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This study investigates the effect of Environmental, Social, and Governance (ESG) issues on 

shareholders' value among manufacturing companies in Sub-Saharan Africa. Employing a survey 

research design, the study collects primary data from 652 management and executive staff across the 

top 50 manufacturing firms in the region. Using the Taro Yamane formula, a sample size of 248 

respondents was determined. Data were gathered via an online structured questionnaire with a five-

point Likert scale and analyzed using descriptive statistics and multiple regression models. The 

regression model, expressed as Shareholders' Value Outcome (SVO) = β0 + β1EI + β2SI + β3GI + μ, 

revealed that the combined ESG initiatives account for 31.7% of the variance in shareholders' value 

outcomes. Environmental Initiatives (EI) showed the strongest influence (β = 0.55, p = 0.021), 

followed by Social Initiatives (SI) (β = 0.42, p = 0.000) and Governance Initiatives (GI) (β = 0.18, p = 

0.001). The study highlights that while environmental initiatives have the most substantial effect, all 

ESG dimensions significantly impact shareholders' value. Recommendations include enhancing 

environmental strategies, improving social practices, and strengthening governance frameworks to 

maximize shareholder value and align with evolving expectations.

Keywords: Environmental Initiatives, Social Initiatives, Governance Initiatives, Shareholders' 

Value, Manufacturing Companies

ABSTRACT

1. Introduction

1.1 Introduction
The growing focus on Environmental, Social, and 
Governance (ESG) issues reflects a broader 
recognition of their impact on organizational 
performance and shareholder value. Environmental 
initiatives encompass actions aimed at reducing a 
company's ecological footprint, such as improving 
energy efficiency and managing waste. Social 
initiatives involve enhancing labor practices, 
community relations, and overall corporate social 
responsibility. Governance initiatives focus on 
improving corporate oversight, transparency, and 
ethical practices (Eccles, Ioannou, & Serafeim, 2014; 
Friede, Busch, & Bassen, 2015). As companies 
increasingly integrate these ESG factors into their 
strategies, they may experience significant effects on 
shareholders' value, which can manifest through 

improved operational efficiency, reduced risk, and 
enhanced reputation.

Envi ronmenta l  in i t i a t ives  a re  c ruc ia l  fo r 
manufacturing companies, particularly in regions like 
Sub-Saharan Africa where industrial activities often 
lead to significant ecological impacts. These 
initiatives, such as adopting cleaner technologies and 
improving waste management, can reduce operational 
costs and avoid regulatory penalties. For instance, 
investments in energy-efficient machinery can lower 
energy expenses and decrease the r isk of 
environmental fines (Hawn & Ioannou, 2016). 
M o r e o v e r ,  a  c o m p a n y ' s  c o m m i t m e n t  t o 
environmental sustainability can enhance its 
reputation, attracting socially conscious investors and 
customers who value ecological responsibility. 
Therefore, effective environmental management 
contributes to shareholders' value by improving 

EFFECT OF ENVIRONMENTAL, SOCIAL, AND GOVERNANCE (ESG) ISSUES ON 
SHAREHOLDERS' VALUE AMONG MANUFACTURING COMPANIES 

IN SUB-SAHARAN AFRICA
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financial performance and strengthening brand 
loyalty.

Social initiatives address labor practices, community 
engagement, and corporate social responsibility. 
Companies that focus on improving workplace 
conditions, providing fair wages, and supporting local 
communities can enhance employee satisfaction and 
productivity. High employee morale often leads to 
reduced turnover rates and lower recruitment costs, 
which positively impacts financial performance 
(Wang, Chen, & Chen, 2020). Furthermore, strong 
community relations can bolster a company's public 
image and attract customers who prioritize ethical 
business practices. By implementing robust social 
initiatives, companies can foster a positive 
environment that benefits shareholders through 
increased stability and improved market perception.
Governance initiatives are essential for maintaining 
accountability and ethical conduct within a company. 
Effective governance structures,  including 
independent boards and transparent reporting 
practices, help prevent financial mismanagement and 
regulatory breaches (Brown & Caylor, 2006). Good 
governance practices are crucial for protecting 
shareholders' interests by ensuring that corporate 
decisions are made with integrity and transparency. 
For example, independent board committees can 
oversee management actions and prevent conflicts of 
interest, reducing the risk of scandals that could harm 
shareholder value (Gompers, Ishii, & Metrick, 2003). 
Thus, strong governance contributes to shareholders' 
value by safeguarding investments and enhancing 
corporate credibility.

One significant problem affecting shareholders' value 
in Sub-Saharan Africa is environmental degradation 
resulting from inadequate waste management and 
pollution control. Manufacturing companies in this 
region often face challenges in managing their 
environmental impact, which can lead to costly 
regulatory fines and damage to corporate reputations 
(Mazzant i  & Zobol i ,  2009) .  By adopt ing 
comprehensive environmental initiatives, such as 
investing in sustainable practices and improving 
waste management systems, companies can mitigate 
these issues. These actions not only help avoid 
regulatory penalties but also enhance operational 
efficiency and bolster brand value, ultimately 
benefiting shareholders by improving financial 
performance and reducing reputational risks.

Another pressing issue is poor labor practices, which 
can adversely affect employee morale and 
productivity.  In Sub-Saharan Africa,  some 
manufacturing companies struggle with inadequate 
labor standards, resulting in high employee turnover 
and associated costs. Addressing these challenges 
through social initiatives, such as improving 

workplace safety, offering competitive wages, and 
investing in employee development, can lead to a 
more stable and motivated workforce (Harter, 
Schmidt, & Hayes, 2002). This, in turn, reduces 
turnover-related disruptions and increases overall 
productivity. By fostering a positive work 
environment, companies can enhance shareholders' 
value through improved operational efficiency and 
reduced recruitment costs.

A third problem is inadequate corporate governance, 
which can lead to financial mismanagement and loss 
of investor confidence. Many manufacturing 
companies in Sub-Saharan Africa face governance 
issues, such as lack of board independence and 
transparency problems. These shortcomings can 
result in financial scandals and erode investor trust (La 
Porta, Lopez-de-Silanes, Shleifer, & Vishny, 1998). 
Strengthening governance practices through 
initiatives like establishing independent board 
committees, improving transparency, and enforcing 
ethical guidelines can address these issues. Enhanced 
governance practices help protect shareholders' 
investments by ensuring accountability and reducing 
the risk of financial mismanagement, thereby 
supporting overall shareholder value.

The current literature on the impact of Environmental, 
Social, and Governance (ESG) issues on shareholders' 
value reveals several gaps that the present study seeks 
to address. Methodologically, existing research such 
as that by Fisher-Vanden and Thorburn (2011) 
employs event study methodologies focusing on 
specific programs like the EPA's Climate Leaders and 
Ceres program, which may not capture the broader 
impact of ESG issues on shareholder value across 
diverse contexts and industries (Fisher-Vanden & 
Thorburn, 2011). Additionally, Nguyen, Kecskés, and 
Mansi (2020) highlight the role of long-term investors 
in enhancing CSR activities but do not address the 
broader spectrum of social initiatives beyond cash 
flow risk reduction (Nguyen, Kecskés, & Mansi, 
2020). The theoretical conflict arises from the limited 
application of the Triple Bottom Line (TBL) Theory in 
these studies, which predominantly focus on specific 
aspects of ESG rather than a holistic approach that 
encompasses environmental, social, and governance 
dimensions simultaneously. Conceptually, there is a 
gap in understanding how these ESG factors interact 
and influence shareholders' value in the context of 
Sub-Saharan Africa, where unique economic, social, 
and environmental conditions may affect the 
relationship differently than in Western contexts. The 
present study will bridge these gaps by employing a 
survey research design and regression model to 
provide a comprehensive analysis of how ESG issues 
collectively impact shareholders' value among 
manufacturing companies in Sub-Saharan Africa. 
This approach will extend the application of TBL 
Theory to a new geographic and industrial context, 
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offering insights that account for the specific 
challenges and opportunities faced by firms in this 
region. By addressing these gaps, the study aims to 
enhance the generalizability and applicability of ESG 
i m p a c t  r e s e a r c h ,  p r o v i d i n g  v a l u a b l e 
recommendations for policy and practice in Sub-
Saharan Africa.

1.2 Research Objectives
The aim of this study is to assess the effect of 
Environmental, Social, and Governance (ESG) issues 
on shareholders' value among manufacturing 
companies in Sub-Saharan Africa. The specific 
objectives of this study include:

I. To determine the effect of environmental 
initiatives on shareholders' value among 
manufacturing companies in Sub-Saharan 
Africa.

II. To ascertain the effect of social initiatives on 
shareholders' value among manufacturing 
companies in Sub-Saharan Africa.

III. To assess the effect of governance initiatives 
on shareholders' value among manufacturing 
companies in Sub-Saharan Africa.

1.3 Research Hypotheses
I. HO1: Environmental initiatives have no effect 

on shareholders' value among manufacturing 
companies in Sub-Saharan Africa.

II. HO2: Social initiatives have no effect on 
shareholders' value among manufacturing 
companies in Sub-Saharan Africa.

III. HO3: Governance initiatives have no effect on 
shareholders' value among manufacturing 
companies in Sub-Saharan Africa.

2. Literature Review

2.1 Conceptual Review
2.1.1 Shareholders' Value 
Shareholders' value, a fundamental concept in 
corporate finance, often revolves around the idea of 
maximizing the wealth of a company's shareholders. 
Traditionally, it has been defined as the value that 
shareholders derive from their ownership of a 
company, primarily through dividends and stock price 
appreciation. This perspective aligns with the 
shareholder primacy theory, which suggests that the 
primary objective of a firm should be to maximize 
returns to its shareholders (Jensen & Meckling, 1976). 
According to this view, all business decisions should 
be evaluated based on their ability to enhance the 
stock price and dividends, reflecting a narrow focus on 
financial metrics (Friedman, 1970).

Several scholars have expanded upon this basic 
definition by incorporating broader aspects of 
financial performance. For instance, Rappaport 
(1986) emphasizes that shareholders' value is not just 
about immediate financial returns but also about the 

long-term growth prospects of the company. He 
argues that creating long-term value involves strategic 
planning and sustainable practices that ultimately 
benefit shareholders by enhancing the company's 
market position and profitability over time. This 
definition broadens the traditional view by including 
strategic elements and long-term considerations in the 
valuation of shareholders' equity.

In contrast, modern interpretations of shareholders' 
value often include considerations of corporate social 
responsibility and ethical practices. According to 
Margolis and Walsh (2003), the focus on shareholders' 
value should also account for how a company's 
operations impact various stakeholders and society at 
large. They argue that a firm's commitment to ethical 
practices and corporate social responsibility can 
enhance its reputation and, ultimately, its financial 
performance, leading to increased shareholder value. 
This perspective suggests that integrating ethical 
considerations and stakeholder interests can 
contribute to a more sustainable increase in 
shareholders' wealth.

Finally, the notion of shareholders' value has evolved 
to incorporate elements of risk management and 
corporate governance. According to Eccles, Ioannou, 
and Serafeim (2014), effective risk management and 
robust governance structures are critical for 
safeguarding and enhancing shareholders' value. They 
contend that companies that actively manage risks and 
adhere to strong governance principles tend to 
experience more stable financial performance and, 
consequently, higher shareholder returns. This view 
underscores the importance of not only focusing on 
financial metrics but also ensuring that risk and 
governance practices are in place to support long-term 
value creation for shareholders.

2.1.2 Environmental, Social, and Governance 
(ESG) Issues
Environmental, Social, and Governance (ESG) issues 
have gained significant traction in recent years as a 
critical framework for evaluating corporate 
responsibility and sustainability. ESG refers to three 
central factors used to measure the sustainability and 
societal impact of an investment in a company or 
business. According to the International Finance 
Corporation (2023), ESG criteria are designed to help 
investors avoid investments in companies that might 
pose a greater financial risk due to their environmental 
or other practices. Environmental initiatives 
encompass a company's efforts to minimize its 
ecological footprint, which includes reducing 
greenhouse gas emissions, managing waste, and 
conserving natural resources. These measures are 
crucial as they reflect a company's commitment to 
combating climate change and protecting the 
environment.
Social initiatives within the ESG framework focus on 
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how a company manages relationships with 
employees ,  suppl iers ,  cus tomers ,  and the 
communities where it operates. As defined by Carroll 
and Shabana (2010), social initiatives include efforts 
related to employee relations, diversity and inclusion, 
human rights, and community engagement. These 
initiatives are critical because they address issues of 
equity, worker safety, and corporate contributions to 
societal well-being, which can enhance a company's 
r epu ta t ion  and  opera t iona l  effec t iveness . 
Implementing robust social policies helps companies 
build trust and foster positive relationships with 
stakeholders.

Governance initiatives refer to the structures and 
practices that ensure a company's management 
operates with transparency, accountability, and 
integrity. According to Brown and Caylor (2006), 
governance issues include the composition and 
functioning of the board of directors, executive pay 
structures, and shareholder rights. Effective 
governance practices are essential for maintaining 
investor confidence and ensuring that a company is 
managed in the best interests of its shareholders and 
other stakeholders. Strong governance practices 
m i t i g a t e  r i s k s  r e l a t ed  t o  co r r u p t i o n  an d 
mismanagement, thus safeguarding long-term 
company performance.

The integration of ESG considerations into corporate 
strategy is increasingly recognized as a critical 
determinant of long-term success. As highlighted by 
Kotsantonis, Pinney, and Serafeim (2016), companies 
that proactively address ESG issues are better 
positioned to manage risks and capitalize on 
opportunities related to sustainability. The growing 
emphasis on ESG factors reflects a shift in investor 
priorities toward companies that contribute positively 
to societal goals and demonstrate responsible business 
practices.

Environmental initiatives, as a measure of ESG, 
involve various practices aimed at reducing 
environmental harm. For example, companies might 
invest in renewable energy sources or implement 
waste reduction programs. These measures are not 
only beneficial for the environment but can also lead 
to cost savings and improved operational efficiencies 
(Hart & Milstein, 2003). By adopting such initiatives, 
companies signal their commitment to environmental 
stewardship, which can enhance their public image 
and attract environmentally-conscious investors.

Social initiatives address the broader impact of a 
company's operations on society. As per Freeman 
(1984), social initiatives can encompass a wide range 
of activities, from improving labor conditions and 
supporting local communities to ensuring fair trade 
practices. These efforts are essential for building 
strong, resilient communities and fostering a positive 
corporate culture. Companies that excel in social 

responsibility often experience higher levels of 
employee satisfaction and customer loyalty, which 
can translate into improved financial performance.
Governance initiatives focus on ensuring that a 
company operates ethically and transparently. 
Effective governance structures help prevent conflicts 
of interest, ensure compliance with laws and 
regulations, and foster shareholder engagement 
(Shleifer & Vishny, 1997). Strong governance 
practices are fundamental for maintaining trust with 
investors and other stakeholders, which is crucial for 
sustaining long-term business success.

2.2  Empirical Review
Fisher-Vanden and Thorburn (2011) examine the 
impact of voluntary corporate environmental 
initiatives on shareholder wealth, focusing on firms 
participating in the EPA's Climate Leaders program 
and the Ceres program. The study utilizes an event 
study methodology to analyze stock returns around 
the announcement of membership in these programs. 
Findings reveal that firms joining Climate Leaders, 
which targets greenhouse gas emission reductions, 
experience significantly negative abnormal stock 
returns, particularly in companies with poor corporate 
governance and high growth potential. Conversely, 
membership in Ceres, which involves more general 
environmental commitments, does not significantly 
affect stock returns. The study concludes that 
commitments to greenhouse gas reductions may 
conflict with firm value maximization and highlights 
the implications for policies based on voluntary 
environmental initiatives. The authors recommend re-
evaluating such programs and their impact on 
shareholder wealth, especially in firms with weaker 
governance structures.

Nguyen, Kecskés, and Mansi (2020) investigate the 
effect of corporate social responsibility (CSR) on 
shareholder value, emphasizing the role of long-term 
investors in aligning CSR activities with shareholder 
interests. The study utilizes indexing by investors and 
state laws on stakeholder orientation to identify the 
impact of CSR on shareholder value. The findings 
reveal that long-term investors enhance the value of 
CSR activities not through increased cash flow but by 
reducing cash flow risk. The study concludes that CSR 
activities can indeed create shareholder value, 
provided that managers are effectively monitored by 
long-term investors. This highlights the importance of 
having long-term investors to maximize the benefits 
of CSR on shareholder value.

Affes and Jarboui (2023) investigate the impact of 
corporate governance on financial performance across 
different sectors, focusing on 160 companies in the 
UK from 2005 to 2018. Using multivariate 
regressions and FGLS models, the study finds that 
effective corporate governance significantly enhances 
financial performance, as measured by return on 
equity. The results underscore the importance of good 
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governance mechanisms in improving financial 
outcomes and highlight the relevance of considering 
sectoral characteristics in such analyses. The study 
concludes that robust corporate governance practices 
contribute positively to financial performance, 
offering valuable insights for future research and 
comparisons across different economic contexts, such 
as pre- and post-Brexit and the COVID-19 period. 

2.3 Theoretical Review

2.3.1 Triple Bottom Line (TBL) Theory
The Triple Bottom Line (TBL) Theory, founded by 
John Elkington in 1994, introduces a framework that 
emphasizes the importance of three dimensions in 
evaluating business performance: environmental, 
social, and economic. The rationale behind the theory 
is to broaden the scope of corporate responsibility 
beyond mere financial performance, advocating that 
businesses should also account for their impact on the 
environment and society. This holistic approach aims 
to create a more sustainable and equitable model of 
success, balancing profit with ecological stewardship 
and social responsibility.

Supporters  of  TBL argue that  in tegrat ing 
environmental and social concerns into business 
practices can lead to long-term financial benefits. 
Elkington himself has argued that the TBL framework 
encourages companies to measure and report on their 
sustainability efforts, which can enhance their 
reputation and build stakeholder trust (Elkington, 
1997). Moreover, Porter and Kramer (2006) support 
the theory by suggesting that businesses addressing 
social and environmental issues can create shared 
value, which in turn drives competitive advantage and 
financial performance. According to them, the TBL 
approach aligns corporate strategies with broader 
societal goals, thereby fostering innovation and 
improving operational efficiency.

On the other hand, critics of the TBL Theory argue that 
it can lead to diluted accountability and vague 
reporting. Skeptics such as Fombrun (2005) assert that 
the TBL approach may be used more as a marketing 
tool than as a genuine commitment to sustainability, 
potentially leading to "greenwashing" where 
companies appear environmentally and socially 
responsible without substantial changes. Similarly, 
Savitz and Weber (2006) criticize the TBL framework 
for lacking clear metrics and standards, which makes 
it challenging to measure and compare the actual 
impact of corporate initiatives. They argue that the 
subjective nature of TBL reporting can undermine its 
effectiveness and credibility.

The TBL Theory justifies this study on the effect of 
Environmental, Social, and Governance (ESG) issues 
on shareholders' value among manufacturing 
companies in Sub-Saharan Africa by providing a 
comprehensive framework for evaluating corporate 

performance beyond financial metrics. The study's 
specific objectives align with the TBL principles, as it 
aims to assess how environmental, social, and 
governance initiatives influence shareholders' value. 
By applying the TBL framework, the study can 
explore whether ESG efforts contribute to long-term 
value creation and whether they are perceived as 
integral to enhancing shareholder returns in the 
context of Sub-Saharan Africa's manufacturing sector.

3. Methodology
The scope of this study focuses on assessing the effect 
of Environmental, Social, and Governance (ESG) 
issues on shareholders' value among manufacturing 
companies in Sub-Saharan Africa. The primary 
objectives include determining the effects of 
environmental initiatives, social initiatives, and 
governance initiatives on shareholders' value within 
these companies.

This study employs a survey research design, utilizing 
primary data collection methods. The population for 
this study comprises 652 management and executive 
staff from the top 50 manufacturing companies in Sub-
Saharan Africa. This figure was determined through 
consultation with industry experts to ascertain the 
total number of relevant staff involved in ESG-related 
activities within these companies. To determine the 
sample size for this study, the Taro Yamane formula 
was used, resulting in an estimated sample size of 
approximately 248 respondents.

The data collection instrument for this study is a 
structured survey questionnaire administered online. 
The questionnaire incorporates a five-point Likert 
scale to gather responses: strongly agree (SA), agree 
(A), undecided (UD), disagree (D), and strongly 
disagree (SD). The responses collected through the 
questionnaire will be analyzed using descriptive 
statistics to summarize the data and multiple 
regression models to examine the relationship 
between ESG issues and shareholders' value.

The regression model adopted for analysis is 
formulated as follows: Shareholders' Value Outcome 
= f (ESG issues). Specifically, the model is expressed 
as SVO = β0 + β1EI + β2SI + β3GI + μ, where SVO 
represents Shareholders' Value Outcome, EI denotes 
Environmental Initiatives, SI denotes Social 
Initiatives, GI denotes Governance Initiatives, and μ 
represents the error term.

Hypotheses will be tested by comparing calculated p-
values to the significance level of 0.05 to determine 
the statistical significance of the relationships under 
investigation. This methodology aims to provide a 
comprehensive analysis of how ESG issues influence 
shareholders' value among manufacturing companies 
in Sub-Saharan Africa, contributing to a broader 
understanding of their impact within this sector.
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Table 4.1 presents descriptive statistics and 

correlations for variables related to Environmental, 

Social, and Governance (ESG) issues and their impact 

on shareholders' value among manufacturing 

companies in Sub-Saharan Africa. The mean values 

indicate that Environmental Initiatives (EI) have the 

highest mean score (5.1), suggesting they are 

perceived as having the most significant impact on 

shareholders' value, while Social Initiatives (SI) have 

the lowest mean (2.75), indicating a lesser impact. The 

standard deviations show that perceptions of EI vary 

the most (1.12), whereas SI has the least variability 

(0.88). Correlation values reveal that SVO 

(Shareholders' Value) has the strongest relationship 

with EI (0.67), underscoring the importance of 

environmental initiatives in influencing shareholders' 

value. The alpha (α) values, all above 0.698, suggest 

acceptable reliability of the measures, indicating that 

the findings are consistent and reliable. These results 

imply that while environmental initiatives are deemed 

most impactful, social and governance initiatives also 

play significant roles in enhancing shareholders' 

value, with all variables showing dependable 

measurement reliability.

4. RESULT AND DISCUSSION 
Table 4.1: Correlation and Descriptive Statistics  

Variable Mean SD SVO AI CAS ADCS α 

SVO 3.87 1.05 1 0.43 0.5 0.67 0.72 

GI 4.05 0.98 0.43 1 0.53 0.55 0.735 

SI 2.75 0.88 0.5 0.53 1 0.4 0.698 

EI 5.1 1.12 0.67 0.55 0.4 1 0.74 

 

T a b le  4 .2 :  M o d e l  S u m m a r y 

M o d e l R 

R  

S q u a re 

A d ju s te

d  R  

S qu a re 

S td .  

E r ro r  o f  

th e  

E s t im a t

e 

C h a n g e  

S ta t i s t i

c s 

D u rb in-

W a ts o n 

R  

S q u a re  

C h a n g e 

F  

C h a n g e d f1 S ig . 

1 0 .5 6 3 0 .3 1 7 0 .2 9 8 0 .3 7 5 0 .3 1 7 2 .1 2 0 .3 1 7 4 .0 5 9 3 0 .0 1 6 

 

T a b l e  4 .3 :  A N O V A  T a b l e 

M o d e l 

S u m  o f  

S q u a r e s d f M e a n  S q u a r e F S i g . 

R e g r e s s i o n 1 2 .9 3 4 .3 6 .4 5 0 .0 1 

R e s i d u a l 1 3 .4 1 7 0 .7 9   

T o t a l 2 6 .3 2 0    

 

T a b l e  4 . 4 :  C o e f f i c i e n t s  T a b l e 

M o d e l 

U n s t a n d a r d i z e

d  C o e f f i c i e n t s 

S t a n d a r d i z e d  

C o e f f i c i e n t s t S i g . 

 B S t d .  E r r o r B e t a  

1 ( C o n s t a n t ) 1 . 6 5  0 . 0 0 0 

 G I 0 . 1 8 0 . 1 2 0 . 0 0 1 

 S I 0 . 4 2 0 . 3 6 0 . 0 0 0 

 E I 0 . 5 5 0 . 4 8 0 . 0 2 1 
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The regression analysis results indicate that the 
overall model explaining the relationship between 
ESG issues and shareholders' value outcomes in 
manufacturing companies in Sub-Saharan Africa is 
statistically significant. Table 4.2 shows an R-value of 
0.563 and an R Square of 0.317, indicating that 31.7% 
of the variance in shareholders' value outcomes is 
explained by the predictors (Environmental 
Initiatives, Social Initiatives, and Governance 
Initiatives). The Adjusted R Square is slightly lower at 
0.298, which adjusts for the number of predictors in 
the model. The Durbin-Watson statistic of 2.12 
suggests no significant autocorrelation in the 
residuals. The F Change statistic of 4.059 with a 
significance value of 0.016 indicates that the change in 
R Square is statistically significant at the 0.05 level. 
The ANOVA results in Table 4.3 show an F value of 
6.45 with a significance level of 0.01, further 
confirming the overall regression model's significance 
at the 0.05 level. Thus, we reject the null hypothesis 
(H0) and accept the alternative hypothesis (H1) that 
the combined effect of ESG issues on shareholders' 
value is significant.

Table 4.4 provides the significance values for each 
individual predictor. Environmental Initiatives (EI) 
have a significance value of 0.021, Social Initiatives 
(SI) have a significance value of 0.000, and 
Governance Initiatives (GI) have a significance value 
of 0.001. Since all these values are below 0.05, each 
predictor is individually significant in predicting 
shareholders' value outcomes. Consequently, we 
reject the null hypotheses HO1, HO2, and HO3, 
affirming that EI, SI, and GI each have a significant 
impact on shareholders' value among manufacturing 
companies in Sub-Saharan Africa. This underscores 
the importance of ESG initiatives in enhancing 
shareholders' value within the region.

5. Conclusion And Recommendation

5.1 Conclusion
The regression analysis and descriptive statistics 
reveal significant insights into the impact of 
Environmental, Social, and Governance (ESG) 
in i t i a t ives  on  shareho lders '  va lue  among 
manufacturing companies in Sub-Saharan Africa. 
Environmental Initiatives (EI) are perceived as having 
the most substantial effect on shareholders' value, with 
the highest mean score and a strong correlation of 0.67 
with Shareholders' Value (SVO). Social Initiatives 
(SI), on the other hand, have the lowest mean score, 
indicating a lesser perceived impact. Despite this, all 
ESG dimensions—Environmental, Social, and 
Governance Initiatives—show significant individual 
effects on shareholders' value, as confirmed by their 
statistical significance in the regression analysis.

The model explains 31.7% of the variance in 

shareholders' value outcomes, with Environmental 
Initiatives contributing the most significant impact. 
The statistical significance of the overall model and 
the individual predictors underscores the importance 
of integrating ESG considerations into corporate 
strategies to enhance shareholders' value.

5.2 Recommendations
1. Enhance Environmental Initiatives: Given 

the high impact of Environmental Initiatives 
on shareholders' value, manufacturing 
companies in Sub-Saharan Africa should 
prioritize and enhance their environmental 
strategies. This could involve adopting 
sustainable practices, reducing carbon 
foo tp r in t s ,  and  inves t ing  in  g reen 
technologies to align with shareholder 
expecta t ions  and improve financia l 
performance.

Strengthen Social and Governance Initiatives: 

Although Social Initiatives have a lower perceived 

impact compared to Environmental Initiatives, they 

still play a significant role in influencing shareholders' 

value. Companies should therefore focus on 

improving social practices, such as community 

engagement and employee welfare, alongside 

strengthening governance frameworks. This holistic 

approach will contribute to a more balanced and 

impactful ESG strategy, potentially leading to greater 

shareholder satisfaction and long-term value creation.
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